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BID RENEWAL AWARD
D
RFB #116-14 2 19"40roRRecop,
Vehicle Oil/Filter Change and Wash AP
Effective June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017 R 26 2015
IFER

VENDOR

ERVICE REQUIRED Valvoline Express Care and Kwik Kar Wash

edan Oil Change 5 qt w/ filter $31.88

ick-Up Oil Change 5 gt wi filter $31.88

iesel Pick-up w/ filter ‘ $54.92

iesel Pick-up 9 qt w/ filter $72.92
iesel Pick-up 10 gts w/ filter " $77.42

IDiesel Pick-up 14 gt wi filter $94.97

an Qil Change 5 qt w/ filter $31.88

ynthetic Oil* & Filter Change (*GM
ehicles that require Dexox Blend) - $58.72

harge for additional quarts of oil : $4.50

harge for additional quarts of Syn. Oil -
/30 blend & 0/20 blend

pecial Filter Charge on 2012 & up
$2.00

ilter Charge on Ford 6.0 Diesel : $10.00

tate Inspection Sticker : $7.00 or prevailing State Fee

iscount on small parts 10%

asic Car Wash Sedans , $6.00
asic Car Wash Pick-Ups ~ $6.00

asic Car Wash Vans ‘ $6.00

Any services over $500.00 will require a Purchase Order. ‘Purchase orders will not be
required for services off of the above schedule




R RECORD
HUNT COUNTY BID RENEWAL AWARD Ji.lfg':o% loc _P__
FORMAL BID #102-13 VEHICLE FUEL AND OIL
Effective June 1, 2016 through May 31, 2017 APR 26 2016

Product Required VENDOR
: s : v e . Douglas T R
Distributing

Douglass  |(formally Pleasant] Standard
Distributing i Petroleum

Unleaded Gasoline All Precincts

#2 Hi-way Diesel All Precincts

Fuel Tank Monitors & Inventory at
no charge to county?

NOTE: Vendors must furnish copy of vendor's invoice reflecting last purchased price with each invoice
rendered to Hunt County.

4Duron E 15/40wt | sss0/gal

(Rotella (T1540) 15-40 wtbulk | $8.50/gal |

4b|Alternate - Mobile Fleet 15w40buk | $7.90/gal | NoBid

jAlternate - Douglass Premium 15w40 NoBid {  NoBid

Alternate - Petro Canada 15w40 No B|d | NoBid
Delo 15-40 wt bulk i ] $12 95 l gai ~ NoBid
Alternate - Mobile Fleet 15w40 bulk | $7.90!gal . No Bid

5b|Alternate - Douglass Premium 15w40 No Bid

Alternate - Petro Canada 15w40 | NoBid

)|Mercon / | Dextron Type III ATF 55 gal

7|GL-5 Gear Oil 5 Gallon drum .
$2 45 1 tubel 10
Grease #GR2 (tubes) ek
10w TO2 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum
)| 10w TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum

40w TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum No Bid o
50w TO4 Hydraulic Oil 55 Gal Drum | $729.00/drm |

3|Proof of Insurance Provided Yes 1 ‘es B
Doulass Distributing (Sherman) - Sandi McKenzie (903) 813-5176 or Rodney Reed (903) 813-5148

Page 1 of 1
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LEASE AGREEMENT AER SRR .

This Agreement of Lcase (“Lease™) is effective as of June 15, 2016, although not necessarxly
executed on such date, by and between Phase 11 Investments, LP 445 East FM 1382, Suite 3-345, Cedar
Hill TX 75104 (“Landlord”) and The County of Hunt Pct 2, 2500 Lee Street Greenville, TX 75403
{(“Tenant™).

Leased Premises: Approximately 2 acres out of 96 acres in Caddo Mills, TX (Hunt County)
located "4 mile west of the intersection of FM 36 on the South Service Road of I-30.

Term: The term of this Lease is for one year, commencing on June 15, 2016. The Ténant shall
have the option to renew this lease for a one (1) year period upon the mutual agreement of both the
Landlord and the Tenant.

Rent: Tenant will pay Landlord annual rent of $1,800 payable on the date of execution of this
agreement,

Use:  Tenant shall use the Leased Premises exclusively for Stock Pile Land. Tenant shall not
make any other use of the property, or install any improvements, without the Landlord’s written consent.
Tenant shall not dump any garbage, waste, or debris on the premises and will keep it in clean condition.
Tenant cannot sublet the property without the Landlord’s consent.

Termination: Upon termination of this Lease, Tenant shall deliver to Landlord the Leased
Premises in as good a condition as of the effective date of this Lease.

Addresses: All notices and rent shall be mailed to landlord at the following address:

Name: Phase 11 Investments
Address: 445 East FM 1382
Suite 3-345
Cedar Hill, TX 75104
Phone: 214-405-3507
Fax: 214-853-5621

All notices shall be mailed to tenant at the following address:

Name: Hunt County, Texas Pct 2
Address: PO Box 1097

Greenville, TX 75403
Phone: 903-408-4195
Fax: 903-408-4298

Landlord is not responsible for any damage, loss or injury that results from the Tenant, Tenants agents,
employees or contractors while using the property. Tenant agrces to indemnify and hold harmless
Landlord from claims arising from any damage, loss or injury and from any loss, expgnse or liability,
including attorney’s fees.

LANDLORD:
Phase 11 Investments, LP

FWNSE

Kim Schivimmer, President and Chief Manager /
Tex Mifin LLC, it’s General Partner /

i FOR RECO
(N // % o clock

MAY 11 2016

JE F'ERU ENZWEIG
By. .
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- ev!n Moore Ruben Santana Grace Torres - Jorge Guerra - Alan Rosner ;

End User: HUNT COUNTY COMMISSIONER PCT 2

Sam Pack's Five Star Ford
1635 S. IH 35E Carroliton Texas, 75006

(888) 8 FLEET 9 (886-835-3389) - FAX 972-245-5278 - biditx{ pford com

: _ Carsand nght Trucks

- Texas Smartbuy Contract

Contact: CHERYL LOWRY
Contact TN/Email clowry@huntcounty net

Sam Pack's Rep:

Date:

Effective 9-1-2015

' 08-31-16 '

Ruben Santana

4/18/2016

Phone # 903-408-4148

Exterior Color / WHITE

Product Description: 2016 Ford F-250 Pickup Crew Cab 4x4 6.2L Gas Short Bed Interior
A Bid Series: 868C ending in W2B XLT Base Price: $ 25,353.67
B. Published Options (Itemize Each Below
Code Description Bid Price Code Description Bid Price
Automatic Included Out Of Stock
Air Conditioning Included
90L Power Group Included
525 Speed Control Included
Long Bed Included
Trailer Tow Included
6.2L Gasoline Engine Included
156" Wheel Base Included
942 Daytime Running Lights Included
868C 4x4 Option $ 2,273.00
Total of B. - Published Options| $ 2,273.00
C. Ford Factory Published Options
Code Description Bid Price Code Description Bid Price
Total of C. - Dealer Published Options| $ -
D. Fleet Quote
Code Description Bid Price Code Description Bid Price
w28 Upgrade to Crew Cab $ 2,120.00
XLT Upgrade to XLT $3,200.00
All Vehicles ordered are about 90-120 days ARO Total of D. - Off Menu Options| $ 5,320.00
F. Delivery Charges 0 Miles @ $2.45/mile $ -
G. Option Discounts 3 -
H. Totalof A+B+C+D+E=F 32,946.67
R Floor Plan Assistance 50.00
J. Lot insurance Coverages $0.00
K. Quantity Ordered 1 X F= $ 32,946.67
L. Administrative Fee $ -
M. Non-Equip Charges & Credits
N. TOTAL PURCHASE PRICE INCLUDING ADMIN FEE $32,946.67

o'clock P M

D FOR RECORD
APR 26 2016
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METRO - REPRO, INC.
Phone: 817-975-2492 ¢ 3} Hl Dq , (‘7)

cwinkle@metrorepro.com

Hunt County Clerk Office April 19, 2016

2507 Lee Street updated from May 13, 2015
Greenville, Texas 75401 Salesperson: Cary WINKLE
Jennifer Lindenzweig (903) 408-4130 Jlindenzweig@huntcounty.net

1 each Plot Wave 360 : COPIER / SCANNER / PRINTER

Digital_Copier / Printer
. 2-Roll Media Capacity

Fl
. 600x1200 dpi print resolution at__Qj;iD 5%:; fc?fcono
. Manual cut sheet bypass M
. "Instant On" ... no warm up time

. On-Board USB port / Flashdrive
* Documents can be scanned to or printed from on-board flashdrive

**¥¥xkk%% B D-size (24x36) per minute output speed

Integrated Controller
. Supports wireless application i.e.. Smart phone, Ipad
. Network card

. Includes All operational software
* Document Submission
* Document Retrieval
* Web-based Print Manager/Administrator

On-Board Color Scanner

. Integrated on top printer for compact single footprint
. Provides both Coping and Digital scanning

. Color Printer/Scanning Display

. Scan-to-File / Scan-to-Net

. Color Scanning enabled

. 600x600 dpi optical scanning resolution
. Reduction & Enlargement

. 4.5 inches per second scanning speed @600 dpi.mono)
. 36 inch scan width

Adobe PS3/PDF (Provides PDF File Support)
Delivery, Installation, Training List price: $25,488.00

Price with TRADE IN of Xerox 510 $15,000.00
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STATE OF TEXAS JENNIER LINDENZWEIG
OFFICE OF THE GOVERNOR W‘E%Mg%“gp

Texans expect their governments to be open and transparent, never

forgetting that governments work on behalf of the people. As stewards of
taxpayers’ hard-earned money, public purchasers are committed to
earning Texans’ trust by demonstrating wise, cost-effective methods for

making purchases and allocating public resources.

At the local, county and state levels, these hardworking men and
women seek to ensure the highest level of integrity in their profession by
fostering accountability, increasing operational efficiency and working to

promote uniform public purchasing standards.

Each year, an awareness campaign is conducted in March to
recognize public purchasing professionals across the Lone Star State for

their commitment to excellence in government purchasing.

At this time, | encourage all Texans to recognize the outstanding
contributions of public purchasers. Their dedication signals once again that

this state’s greatest asset is the people who call it home.

Therefore, 1, Greg Abbott, Governor of Texas, do hereby proclaim

March 2016 to be

Public Purchasing Month

in Texas, and urge the appropriate
recognition whereof.

In official recognition whereof,

I hereby affix my signature this the
29" day of February, 2016.

Yy 2%

Governor &t exas




D clamats. *14,092

WHEREAS, mental health is essential to everyone’s overall health and well-being; and
WHEREAS, all Americans experience times of difficulty and stress in their lives; and
WHEREAS, prevention is an effective way to reduce the burden of mental illness; and

WHEREAS, there is a strong body of research that supports specific tools that all Americans
can use to better handle challenges and protect their health and well-being,; and

WHEREAS, mental illness is real and prevalent in our nation, and

WHEREAS, with early and effective treatment, those individuals with mental illness can
recover and lead full productive lives,; and

WHEREAS, each business, school, government agency, healthcare provider, organization and
citizen shares the burden of mental illness and has a responsibility to promote mental wellness

and support prevention efforts.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT PROCLAIMED, by the Hunt County Commissioner’s Court that
May 2016 be recognized as “MENTAL HEALTH AWARENESS MONTH?” in Hunt County,
and encourage the support and participation of all citizens, government agencies, public and
private institutions, businesses and schools in Hunt County to recommit our community to
increasing awareness and understanding of mental health and the need for appropriate and
accessible services for all people with mental illness at all stages, and especially before a

suicidal death occurs.

In official witness whereof this 26" day of April, 2016.

E;ic Evans, Precinct 1 Tod McMahan, Precinct 2
‘_;%%Q_QW | ohret
Phillip Martin, Precinct 3 Jim Latham, Precinct 4
FILED FOR RECORD
a(_JQ,Eﬂo’clock_L_M

/ JENNIFER LINDENZWE!
k Hont County,

By,
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Lakes Regional Community Center

Utilization of County Funds for Substance Abuse Services in Hunt Co
2t Quarter Report

December — February 2016

Lakes Regional Ist QTR Hours Comment
Substance Abuse Services | # Clients of
Served Service
Screening and 59 5 Assessment is required for entry into education classes
Evaluation programs.
Self-Pay Education Classes:
¢ DWI Education 10 12.5 Clients are referred from probation and pay total cost of
Class class. Most classes require a minimum number of 10 to
¢ Drug Offender 38 15.5 be cost effective.
Education Class ‘
e Repeat Offender 11 45
DWI

Lakes Hunt County Supported Indigent Counseling and Treatment Services

County Funds support approximately 30% of the cost of these treatment services. They are used to start services
immediately while alternative funding is sought — (i.e. NorthSTAR). County funding supports ongoing services
for those individuals not eligible for NorthSTAR funding. For the new year county funding will help support our
new program for children and adolescents. Family and client fees are also set to augment low payment rates
from NorthSTAR and other payers.

Substance Abuse Ist QTR Hours Comment
Counseling Program | # Clients of
Served Service
Intake Evaluation 17 2.5 Majority of referrals come from probation and self-
referral Intake is required to assess eligibility for other
services below.
Supportive Outpatient 14 3 per Classes are last 90 days and groups have a minimum of
Program — Adults week 3 clients.
Intensive Outpatient 19 9 per More intensive classes for which few clients qualify or
Program — Adults week are authorized.
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Page 5 shall be amended to include the following definition —

LOT, FLAG-SHAPED OR PANHANDLE - “Panhandle” or “flag-shaped lot” means an
irregularly shaped lot designed to provide a minimum avenue of road access while allowing
other Lots to be stacked around it creating a narrow strip of land connecting the principal
building site to a public street so that the result is a Lot often shaped something like a flag with a
“flag pole” of access stretching out to the nearest road.

Page 34 shall be amended to include the following section —

Section VI(6)(E) ~ Panhandle or flag-shaped lots shall generally be prohibited, except if
approved by the Commissioners’ Court as consistent with the intent and spirit of these
regulations. The Precinct Commissioner shall advise the Commissioners’ Court if a proposed lot
constitutes a panhandle or flag-shaped lot as defined herein, and the Commissioners’ Court shall
evaluate any problems related to inadequate road and driveway access, shoulder maintenance,
drainage maintenance, addressing, delivery of emergency services, school bus routing, the
preservation of adequate sight distance for public safety, and any other relevant factors that may
affect surrounding property owners or the public at large in making its final determination as part
of the Subdivision process. None of the considerations herein shall be construed as vesting any
right to the creation of panhandle or flag-shaped lots as part of the Subdivision process.

FILED FOR RECORD

at_L230 o’clock‘LM
APR 26 2016

JE IF'ER LINDENZWEIG
By, t Cqunty,
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INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT APR 26 2015

JENN ERLINDENZWEIG
THIS INTERLOCAL AGREEMENT (“ILA”), made and entered into pursuant to the Texas

Interlocal Cooperation Act, Chapter 791, Texas Government Code (the “Act”), by and between the
North Central Texas Council of Governments, hereinafter referred to as “NCTCOG,” having its
principal place of business at 616 Six Flags Drive, Arlington, TX 76011, and Hunt County, a local
government, a state agency, or a non-profit corporation created and operated to provide one or more
governmental functions and services, hereinafter referred to as “Participant,” having its principal place
of business at 2507 Lee Street, Greenville, Texas 75403.

WHEREAS, NCTCOG is a regional planning commission and political subdivision of the State of
Texas operating under Chapter 391, Texas Local Government Code; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to the Act, NCTCOG is authorized to contract with eligible entities to perform
governmental functions and services, including the operation, management and facilitation of
emergency communication services in North Texas; and

WHEREAS, in reliance on such authority, NCTCOG, as part of its 9-1-1 Services Program, has
contracted to construct multiple telecommunication towers on selected sites throughout North Texas,
many of which sites are located on property owned/leased by other local governments; and

WHEREAS, Participant has agreed to allow for the location of one such tower on property owned by
Participant and has represented that it is an eligible entity under the Act, that its governing body has
authorized this Agreement on April 26, 2016 (Date), and that it desires to contract with NCTCOG on
the terms set forth below;

NOW, THEREFORE, NCTCOG and the Participant do hereby agree as follows:

ARTICLE 1: LEGAL AUTHORITY

The Participant represents and warrants to NCTCOG that it is eligible to contract with NCTCOG under
the Act for the purposes recited herein because it is one of the following: a local government, as defined
in the Act (a county, a municipality, a special district, or other political subdivision of the State of Texas
or any other state, or a combination of two or more of those entities, a state agency (an agency of the
State of Texas as defined in Section 771.002 of the Texas Government Code, or a similar agency of
another state), or a non-profit corporation created and operated to provide one or more governmental
functions and services, and it possesses adequate legal authority to enter into this Agreement.

ARTICLE 2: DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT

NCTCOG agrees to construct at its expense a telecommunication tower on property owned by
Participant at the location described on Exhibit A. The description of the tower, including height, design
and materials is set forth on Exhibit B. Construction shall commence no later than June 1, 2016 unless
otherwise agreed by the parties. NCTCOG agrees during the term hereof to maintain the tower and
related facilities at its sole expense. The tower shall at all times be exclusively owned by NCTCOG.
NCTCOG shall have the right at all times to allow third parties access to the tower for installation of
additional third party equipment. Participant shall also have the non-exclusive right of access to the
tower for installation of Participant’s equipment so long as it does not materially interfere with tower
operations. All expenses incurred in the installation of Participant’s equipment, including structural
analysis and possible tower improvements shall be paid by Participant. Participant shall maintain such
equipment at its sole expense.




ARTICLE 3: TOWER REVENUE; INSURANCE

All revenue generated from tower operations, with the exception of Participant equipment, shall be the
property of NCTCOG. All taxes and fees, if any, assessed on such revenue shall be paid by NCTCOG.
PARTICIPANT shall at all times maintain adequate insurance on the tower and all related
improvements, including comprehensive general liability coverage that includes NCTCOG as the tower
owner. Participant shall at all times maintain adequate insurance on its equipment, if any, located on
the tower and shall insure NCTCOG to the extent of its interest in the tower.

ARTICLE 4: TERM

This Agreement shall be effective on the Effective Date shown below and shall remain in full force and
effect for ten (10) years. This Agreement shall automatically renew for successive five (5) year terms
unless sooner terminated in accordance with Article 6 below. Any modification of this Agreement must
comply with the requirements of Article 5 below. Upon termination of this Agreement NCTCOG shall
be responsible at its expense for removing the tower and all related equipment from the tower site.

ARTICLE 5: CHANGES AND AMENDMENTS

This Agreement may be amended only by a written amendment executed by both parties, except that
any alternations, additions, or deletions to the terms of this Agreement which are required by changes
in Federal and State law or regulations are automatically incorporated into this Agreement without
written amendment hereto and shall become effective on the date designated by such law or regulation.

ARTICLE 6: TERMINATION PROCEDURES

NCTCOG or the Participant may cancel this Agreement for cause provided written notice is provided
to the other party specifying the nature of the cause and allowing the defaulting party six (6) months’
time to cure any alleged default under the Agreement. If the default is not cured, this Agreement will
terminate upon thirty (30) days written notice by certified mail to the other party. The parties may also
terminate this Agreement by mutual agreement.

ARTICLE 7: AVAILABILITY OF FUNDING

Except for tort or tort-related claims, this Agreement and all claims, suits, or obligations arising under
or related to this Agreement are subject to and limited to the receipt and availability of funds which are
received from the funding agencies by NCTCOG and that are dedicated for the purposes of this
Agreement. NCTCOG will give prompt written notice to Participant in the event NCTCOG loses
funding. In the event NCTCOG loses funding, Participant and NCTCOG shall immediately terminate
this Agreement.

ARTICLE 8: DISPUTE RESOLUTION

The parties to this Agreement agree to the extent possible and not in contravention of any applicable
state or federal law or procedure established for dispute resolution, to attempt to resolve any dispute
between them regarding this Agreement informally through voluntary mediation, arbitration or any other
local dispute mediation process before resorting to litigation.

ARTICLE 9: MISCELLANEOUS




a. This Agreement has been made under and shall be governed by the laws of the State of
Texas. Venue and jurisdiction of any suit or cause of action arising under, or in
connection with, this Agreement shall lie exclusively in Tarrant County, Texas.

b. The persons executing this Agreement hereby represent that they have authorization to
sign on behalf of their respective entities.

c. This Agreement and the rights and obligations contained herein may not be assigned by
either party without the prior written approval of the other party to this Agreement.

d. All parties agree that should any provision of this Agreement be determined to be
invalid or unenforceable, such determination shall not affect any other term of this
Agreement, which shall continue in full force and effect.

e. To the extent that either party to this Agreement shall be wholly or partially prevented
from the performance within the term specified of any obligation or duty placed on

such party by reason of or through strikes, stoppage of labor, riot, fire, flood, acts of

war, insurrection, accident, order of any court, act of God, or specific cause reasonably

beyond the party's control and not attributable to its neglect or nonfeasance, in such

event, the time for the performance of such obligation or duty shall be suspended until

such disability to perform is removed; provided, however, force majeure shall not

excuse an obligation solely to pay funds.

f. This Agreement and any attachments/addendums, as provided herein, constitute the

complete agreement between the parties hereto, and supersede any and all oral and
written agreements between the parties relating to matters herein.

THIS INSTRUMENT HAS BEEN EXECUTED IN TWO ORIGINALS BY THE PARTIES
HERETO AS FOLLOWS:

(SIGNATURES TO FOLLOW ON NEXT PAGE)




North Central Texas

Council of Governments

Next Generation 911 Services Program
616 Six Flags Drive

Arlington, Texas 76011

NCTCOG Executive Director or Designee

ignature of Executive Director or Designee

Date: f %é
EFFECTIVE DATE: /mu/zo (G
Participant

ficial or Designee

Sﬁv‘/;m— / WU\/

Name of Entlty

B ox_107/

Ma111ng Address

t//C /74 BYZ- @7/

F{y, State, ZIP Cod¢/

a (pTYRIORRECORY
MAY 16 2016

By,

JE

IEER LINDENZWEIG
T t County,




EXHIBIT A
(Legal Description of Tower location)




EXHIBIT B
(Tower Description)



PRECINCT

VENDOR

HUNT COUNTY
BID AWARD

FORMAL BID NO. 141-16, PREMIX OIL AND SAND
Effective 4/13/16 through 4/12/17

PRICE PER TON
DELIVERED

PRICE PER TON
UNDELIVERED

FILED FOR RECORD

035 o'clock

APR 26 2016

One

APAC-Texas
Inc.

$70.00

$57.50

320 Ironhorse Dr, Terrell, T

One

RKHall, LLC

$68.00

$63.00

Hwy 224, Greenville, T

One

One \

Richard
Drake Const

NO BID

NO BID

Heartland
Asphalt

APAC-Texas
Inc.

NO BID

NO BID

$67.50

$57.50

320 Ironhorse Dr, Terrell, TX

RK Hall, LLC

$68.00

$63.00

Hwy 224, Greenville, T

Richard
Drake Const

NO BID

NO BID

Heartland
Asphalt

AF;AC'-Téxasv
Inc.

NO BID

$67.50

NO BID

$57.50

320 lIronhorse Dr, Terrell, TX

RK Hall, LLC

$68.00

$63.00

Hwy 224, Greenville, T

Richard
Drake Const

NO BID

NO BID

Heartland
Asphalt

APAC-Texas
Inc.

NO BID

NO BID

$70.50

$57.50

320 Ironhorse Dr, Terrell, TX

RK Hall, LLC

$68.00

$63.00

Hwy 224, Greenville, T

Richard
Drake Const

NO BID

NO BID

Heartland
Asphailt

NO BID

NO BID

The Purchasing Department recommends award of this bid to all bidders in accordance

__ with Local Government Code §262.027 [e)

Page 1 of 1



*  PRICE/DELIVERY FOITM

FORMAL BID # 141-16; PREMIXED OIL & SAND CONTRACT TWELVE (12) MONTHS

Precinct 1 — 310 East Locust, Celeste, TX 75423 — Commissioner — Eric Evans
Foreman Mark Bussell — Pct Barn (903) 568-4522 FILED FOR RECORD

at_l_ o'clock M
Estimated use for twelve months 4,000 tons.
Firm Fixed Price Delivered: $ 20.00 B __per ton
Firm Fixed Price Picked Up: $ S 7. <0 per ton

|
State your pick up point: _"TELM .

IPayment Terms:  NET 3O
|

ADDITIONAL PRICING

Describ:e any additional pricing (if any) of your company:

grecinct 2 — 2020 Gilmer St., Caddo Mills, TX 75135 — Commissioner — Tod McMahan
: Foreman Greg McDonald — Pct Barn (903) 527-3181

Estimated use for twelve months 600 tons.

:Firm Fixed Price Delivered: § 67. SO ) __per ton

kirm Fixed Price Picked Up: § _ _S 7,50 ~ perton
|

State your pick up point: _ T ERMNE L
Payment Terms: NG&A )\ < (@)

|
ADDITIONAL PRICING

Describk any additional pricing (if any) of your company:
|

RFB #141-?6, Premix Oil & Sand Contract for Hunt County Page 6 of 17



PRICE/DELIVERY FORM

EORMAL BID # 141-16; PREMIXED OIL & SAND CONTRACT TWELVE (12) MONTHS

‘I_’l recinct 3 - 301 Hwy 69 North, Lone Oak, TX 75453 — Commissioner — Phillip Martin
i Foreman Jason White — Pct Barn (903) 662-5332

iistimated use for twelve months 6,200 tons.

EFirrn Fixed Price Delivered: $ ___C’.IS'O_ per ton
.Firm Fixed Price Picked Up: § 5-7______§ O ~ perton
I{State your pick up point: _WLL?
:Payment Terms: ME_,’]’_"_E_Q___

ADDITIONAL PRICING

Describ;e any additional pricing (if any) of your company:
|

****#**************************************************************

Erecmct ~ 1005 % Bois D’ Arc Street, Commerce, TX 75428 — Commissioner — Jim Latham
Foreman Phillip Staton — Pct Barn (903) 886-6321

iEstimated use for twelve months 40 tons,

firm Fixed Price Delivered: § 70_L_S_ O  perton
firm Fixed Price Picked Up:$ §7.50  perton
%State your pick up point: _*/(-EYL(_._E_L._Q, e
Payment Terms: __ NE&T 30

!
ADDITIONAL PRICING

Describ:b any additional pricing (if any) of your company:

RFB #141-16, Premix Oil & Sand Contract for Hunt County Page 7 of 17



-’ -
PRICE/DELIVERY FORM

FORMAL BID # 141-16; PREMIXED OIL & SAND CONTRACT TWELVE ( 12) MONTHS

COMMENTS or EXCEPTIONS

IS YOUR FIRM WILLING TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENTAL ENTITIES TO PIGGYBACK OFF
THIS CONTRACT, IF AWARDEI:/“DER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS:

YES NO

The un&iersigned bidder has carefully examined the [nvitation to Bid and the Certification included therein,
the Staidard Terms and Conditions and the Technical Specifications. ' )

Further] the undersigned understands that by his signature affixed below, he/she agrees to enter into a contract
with Hunt County in accordance with the requirements of the County as stated in the above-referenced contract
documents, and in accordance with additional contract forms and terms of agreement from bidder’s company as
furnishéd by bidder herewith.

AR =TNAS sl -
Company Name oriZed Signature
' N (CLE Pucee /S

Addres$ ame (Printed or Typed)
NN, K 75705 A M
City, Sﬂ:ate, Zip ' Title
Qo3-s6i-(32.l alsfe -

hone ate
Q> A3-(36S LancE U tecPSE APAC. con]
Fax E-Mail

RFB #1416, Premix Oil & Sand Contract for Hunt County Page 8 of 17
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CONFLICT OF INTEREST QUESTIONNAIRE FORM CIQ

For vendor doing business with local governmental entity

This questionnaire reflects changes made to the law by H.B. 23, 84th Leg., Regular Sesslon. OFFICE USE ONLY

This questionnaire is being filed in accordance with Chapter 176, Local Government Code, by a vendor who
has a business relationship as defined by Section 176.001(1-a) with a local governmental entity and the
vendor meets requirements under Section 176.006(a).

Dale Received

By law this questionnaire must be filed with the records administrator of the local governmental entity not later
than the 7th business day after the date the vendor becomes aware of facts that require the statement to be
filed. See Section 176.006(a-1), Local Government Code.

A veridor commits an offense if the vendor knowingly violates Section 176.006, Local Government Code. An
offen$e under this section is a misdemeanor.

1] N‘pme of vendor who has a business relationship with local governmental entity.

o 224 sdS) PS

Check this box if you are filing an update to a previously filed questionnaire. (The law requires that you file an updated
completed questionnaire with the appropriate filing authority not later than the 7th business day after the date on which
you became aware that the originally filed questionnaire was incomplete or inaccurate.)

2]

3] Name of local government officer about whom the information is being disclosed.

) Name of Officer

4] Describe each employment or other business relationship with the local government officer, or a family member of the
officer, as described by Section 176.003(a)(2)(A). Also describe any family relationship with the local government officer.
Complete subparts A and B for each employment or business relationship described. Attach additional pages to this Form
ClQ as necessary.

A. s the local government officer or a family member of the officer receiving or likely to receive taxable income,
other than investment income, from the vendor?

|—_—] Yes l:l No

B. Is the vendor receiving or likely to receive taxable income, other than investment income, from or at the direction
of the local government officer or a family member of the officer AND the taxable income is not received from the
local governmental entity?

‘:’ Yes I_—_l No

—il bescribe each employment or business relationship that the vendor named in Section 1 maintains with a corporation or
other business entity with respect to which the local government officer serves as an officer or director, or holds an
ownership interest of one percent or more.

|

6
g Check this box if the vendor has given the local government officer or a family member of the officer one or more gifts
as described.in Section 176.003(a)(2)(B), excluding gifts described in Section 176.003(a-1).
| 2..a 1
7]

l{cr{((ﬂ

! Signaturf y(/endor dding businéss with the governmental entity Date

Form provided by Texag Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Revised 11/30/2015




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

FORM 1295
lofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2016-41019
Apac Texas
Tyler, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 04/15/2016
being filed.
Hunt County Date Acknowledged:

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the goods or services to be provided under the contract.

141-16
Oil Sand
4 . . Nature of interest {check applicable)
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) - -
Controlling Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .
§ AFFIDAVIT I swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct,

U —Signaw of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said \& ,\(»Q P /'\ i \ S , this the % day ot 'L\Yy‘ {

20 , to certify which, witness my hand and seal of office. v o
NS ~ : MY co:niri}‘.. » EXPIRES
D U (e wpnl (o ot
\élgnat&re of officer administering oath Printed narhe of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.645




CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES
FOrRM 1295

lofl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:

of business. 2016-41019

Apac Texas

Tyler, TX United States Date Filed:
2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 04/15/2016

being filed.

Date Acknowledged:

Hunt County
04/18/2016

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the goods or services to be provided under the contract.

141-16
Oil Sand
4 . . Nature of interest (check applicable)
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) -
Controlling intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.
y rty
6 AFFIDAVIT | swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said , this the day of .
20 . to cenrtify which, witness my hand and seal of office.
Signature of officer administering oath Printed name of officer administering oath Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www.ethics.state.tx.us Version V1.0.645



«,\%,M‘ 099 at_L 5B FORRECORD y

Delores Shelton, CIO, CCT AP
Hunt County Treasurer R 26 2016

N JENNJ kuuosggma
FY 11: Monthly Report, March 2016 g &i Q

The Treasurers’ Monthly Report includes money received and disbursed as well as funds
invested and debt due by Hunt County. The Treasurer’s Books and the Auditor’s General
Ledger agree. The Bank Statements have been reconciled and approved by the County Auditor.

This affidavit must state the amount of cash and other assets that are in the custody of the county
treasurer at the time of the examination. (LGC 114.026) Month End Balance: $28,833,160.16

4

Therefore, Delores Shelton, County Treasurer of Hunt County, Texas, who being fully sworn,
upon oath says that the within and foregoing report is true and correct to the best of her
knowledge.

This report will be filed with accompanying reports this 26 day of April, 2016.

NS g

Delores Shelton, Hunt County Treasurer

Commissioners’ Court having compared and examined thg, Treasurer’s Report as presented and
subject to independent auditor’s rev1ew certlfy the reportfAo be correct and therefore request it be
filed with the official minutes

b .

) /
Eric Evans, Comm., Pct\#‘I/ ..0“0 OFHO ;‘.‘ od McMahan, Comm., Pct #2

Phillip Martii Comm., Pct #3

“nll...




Hunt County Treasurer

Monthly Report
March 2016
Transfer
Hunt County Funds Beginning Money Money In/Out Month End
Balance Received Disbursed Investment Balance

10-GENERAL 9,949,451.51 1,512,359.55 -2,211,494.39 0.00 9,250,316.67
10-TexPool Investment 7,101,668.61 1,974.02 0.00 0.00 7,103,642.63
10-TexStar Investment 1,217,288.26 356.69 0.00 0.00 1,217,644.95
10-InWood Nat'l Bank CD 559,836.58 554.49 0.00 0.00 560,391.07
10-InWood Nat'| Bank CD-2 502,107.47 497.31 0.00 0.00 502,604.78
10-TexPool Investment,Jail 3,149,298.45 875.38 0.00 0.00 3,150,173.83
10-General Fund Totals: 22,479,650.88 1,516,617.44 -2,211,494.39 0.00 21,784,773.93
15-Exchange-Tax & Other 129,543.39 51,402.63 -11,805.02 169,141.00
20-Law Library 33,307.54 6,192.00 -8,162.71 31,336.83
21-R&B #1 20,883.36 85,626.68 -120,165.64 60,000.00 46,344.40
21-R&B #1, TexPool Invest 1,183,939.51 318.88 0.00 -60,000.00 1,124,258.39
21-R&B #1 Fund Totals: 1,204,822.87 85,945.56 -120,165.64 0.00 1,170,602.79
22-R&B #2 17,895.93 126,600.42 -318,020.56 240,000.00 66,475.79
22-R&B #2, TexPool Invest 1,328,188.40 315.98 0.00 -240,000.00 1,088,504.38
22-R&B #2 Fund Totals: 1,346,084.33 126,916.40 -318,020.56 0.00 1,154,980.17
23-R&B #3 16,404.68 85,963.25 -98,875.67 50,000.00 53,492.26
23-R&B #3, TexPool Invest 987,965.30 265.70 0.00 -50,000.00 938,231.00
23-R&B #3 Fund Totals: 1,004,369.98 86,228.95 -98,875.67 0.00 991,723.26
24-R&B #4 19,326.42 85,741.42 -92,225.62 25,000.00 37,842.22
24-R&B #4, TexPool Invest 1,183,266.24 322.58 0.00 -25,000.00 1,158,588.82
24-R&B #4 Fund Totals: 1,202,592.66 86,064.00 -92,225.62 0.00 1,196,431.04
25-Health Private 60,213.01 3,079.76 -2,387.16 60,905.61
26-State Health Services -49,946.95 56,545.49 -29,477.53 -22,878.99
27-Hunt County Grants 37,988.22 9,549.37 -18,778.61 28,758.98
68-JP, DDC Fee Fund 137,347.75 891.00 -120.39 138,118.36
71-DC Record Management 9,329.30 694.23 -4.00 10,019.53
70-Voter Admin 19 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
74-Elections Special 51,005.54 712.80 0.00 51,718.34
75-CA-DWI 11,639.57 540.30 -26.18 12,153.69
81-CC Rec Mgt Preservatic 312,974.74 16,609.39 -2,5613.97 0.00 327,070.16
82-Courthouse Security 24,109.30 4,722.44 -13,604.15 15,227.59
83-Justice Court Sec. 70,495.13 622.08 -644.54 70,472.67




Hunt County Treasurer

Monthly Report
March 2016
Transfer
Hunt County Funds Beginning Money Money In/Out Month End
Balance Received Dishursed Investment Balance
84-District Clerk Archive 41,428.73 783.00 0.00 42,211.73
85-Co & District Court Tec| 10,046.76 417.69 -824.42 9,640.03
86-County Record Preserv 69,530.66 1,710.00 -10.57 71,230.09
87-Justice Court Technolo 05,864.18 2,570.20 -900.32 97,534.06
88-County Clerk Archive 272,035.72 14,460.00 0.00 286,495.72
89-County Record Mgt Pre 681.79 3,256.25 -0.51 3,937.53
91-LEOSE 30,177.02 12,231.10 -590.00 41,818.12
95-Juv Prob. Center Fund 726,785.23 61,911.83 -107,909.26 680,787.80
96-Juv Prob "A-Z" Grant 68,332.48 107,337.18 -48,475.61 127,194.05
50-Debt Service (1&S) 47,209.78 32,568.56 0.00 0.00 79,778.34
50-Debt Service TexPool Ir 192,883.02 53.63 0.00 0.00 192,936.65
50-Debt Service Fund Tota  240,092.80 32,622.19 0.00 0.00 272,714.99
61-Right of Way FundTxPoc 9,038.59 249 0.00 9,041.08
Total of Funds: 29,629,541.22 2,290,635.77 -3,087,016.83 0.00 28,833,160.16
HUNT COUNTY DEBT
Mo. Beginning Payment  Balance Due Pay Off Date
Reserve State Comptroller® 862,941.44 -1,883.23 861,058.21 03/2054
2015 Tax Notes 2,035,000.00 -40,000.00 1,995,000.00
Series 2015 Refund Bonds  3,955,000.00 -970,000.00 2,985,000.00
2005 Refunding Bond 0.00 0.00 0.00 09/30/2019
Liability Comp Absence 317,191.83 0.00 317,191.83
Totals: 7,170,133.27 -1,011,883.23 6,158,250.04
*Beginning Balance $906,351.27 as of 4/2014
45-Bond Series 2015 (TexPool) $0.00 $0.00 0.00 $0.00




2016 TexPool | | Tex Star InWood-CD | {InWood-CD
January 0.2674%]|] 0.2713% 1.25% 1.25%
February 0.3010%|| 0.3147% 1.25% 1.25%
March 0.3273%|| 0.3450% 1.25% 1.25%
2015 TexPool || Tex Star Chase Retiree | | InWood-CD | [InWood-CD| ANB
January 0.0465%|| 0.0542% 0.0300%| | 0.0300% 0.95%

February 0.0441%]| 0.0548% 0.0300%j ]| 0.0300% 0.95%

March 0.0480%|| 0.0604% 0.0300%] } 0.0300% 0.95%

April 0.0524%]] 0.0701% 0.0300%] { 0.0300% 0.95%

May 0.0553%|| 0.0643% 0.0300%]| ]| 0.0300% 0.95%

June 0.0575%}] 0.0719% 0.0000%{ 1 0.0000% 0.95% 0.25%
July 0.0630%]] 0.0722%| |Moved to ANB 0.95% 0.15%
 August 0.0716%]|| 0.0823%] [" " 0.95% 0.15%
September 0.0850%]|{ 0.0994% 0.95%

Qctober 0.0966%]] 0.1099% 1.25% 1.25%
November 0.1105%|1 0.1155% 1.25% 1.25%
December 0.1863% 0.1868% 1.25% 1.25%
2014 TexPool || Tex Star || Chase Retiree | | InWood-CD

January 0.0273%|| 0.0303% 0.0700%| ] 0.0500% 0.75%

February 0.0283%|] 0.0318% 0.0700%/ | 0.0500% 0.75%

March 0.0299%]| 0.0400% 0.0700%]| | 0.0500% 0.75%

April 0.0336%]| 0.0379% 0.0500%]| ]| 0.0300% 0.75%

May 0.0244%|| 0.0273% 0.0500% ] 0.0300% 0.75%

June 0.0284%|} 0.3220% 0.0500%/ | 0.0300% 0.75%

July 0.0313%|| 0.0323% 0.0500%]| ] 0.0300% 0.75%

August 0.0352%]| 0.0350% 0.0500%]| ]| 0.0300% 0.75%

September 0.0333%|]| 0.0317% 0.0500% § 0.0300% 0.75%

QOctober 0.2680%]|| 0.0385% 0.0500%/ | 0.0300% 0.95%

November 0.0286%]|] 0.0387% 0.0500%] | 0.0300% 0.95%

2013 TexPool || Tex Star || Chase Retiree | | InWood-CD

January 0.0986%]|| 0.1103% 0.1500%| | 0.1500% 0.75%

February 0.0935%]|| 0.0996% 0.1500%] | 0.1500% 0.75%

March 0.1047%]| 0.1125% 0.1500%]| | 0.1500% 0.75%

April 0.1022%}| 0.1038% 0.1500% | 0.1500% 0.75%

May 0.0715%|| 0.0723% 0.1500%} ]| 0.1500% 0.75%

June 0.0576%| ! 0.0614% 0.1500%| | 0.1500% 0.75%

July 0.0531%]|| 0.0487% 0.1500%| [ 0.1500% 0.75%

| August 0.0437% 0.0474% 0.1500%] | 0.1500% 0.75%

September 0.0394%]| [ 0.0390% 0.1500%]| | 0.1500% 0.75%

October 0.0498%]|| 0.0434% 0.1200%] | 0.1200% 0.75%

November 0.0446%|| 0.0405% 0.1200%]| | 0.1200% 0.75%

December 0.0372%]| 0.0357% 0.0700%]| ]| 0.0500% 0.75%

Average Rate: | 0.0663%]|| 0.0679% 0.1383%| | 0.1367% 0.75%




£ W oD

HUNT COUNTY ROAD MILEAGE ACCEPTED BY COMMISSIONER'S COURT 04/26/16

PCT. Dirt Rock Oil Sand Seal Coat TOTAL
1 58.09 126.072 50.686 1.16 236.008

2 47.268 130.97 56.168 65.874 300.28

3 22.351 104.948 105.313 19.381 251.993

4 86.94 104.415 104.864 1.129 297.348
TOTAL 214.649 466.405 317.031 87.544 1085.629

Accepted this 26th day of April, 2016.

unty Judge

Jit D Wl

Pct. 3 Comrhissioner Martin

;ZOU 8/‘/’/

b - .
Pct. 1 Commissioner Evans

Pct. 2 Commissioner McMahan

4 Commissioner Latham

e FILED FOR
Jennifer Lindénweig 1D 35 o °,§EC_OL "
APR 26 2016

JEN ER LINDENZWE(G
By. County,



H H. 1D at til_.l_.ggF%orzEcono M“ "

* Farmers et APR 26 2016

Attt g JENMIFER LINDENZWEIG
By, County,

April 1, 2016

Office of Hunt County Commissioner Pct. 3
Phillip Martin

Hunt County Courthouse

2507 Lee St. Room 107

Greenville, Texas 75401

Farmers Electric Cooperative Member: Chris M. Powers
Service Order Number: 1603003379

Dear Commissioner Martin,

Farmers Electric Cooperative, Inc. is requesting permission to construct electrical power
distribution facilities across Hunt County Road 3430 which is located, approximately
1500’ west of CR 3401 in Hunt County, Texas.

Site location map and construction sketches are enclosed. The construction sketch details
the proposed work. All road crossing will have a minimum vertical clearance of 22 feet.

If you have any questions, please contact Cody Bland office, 903-453-0754 or cell, 903-
513-5157.

Sincerely,
Cody Bland

Cody Bland
Engineering Aid

cbland@farmerselectric.coop
Phone 903-453-0754
Mobile 903-513-5157

Submitted by Ra’chel Tidwell
Field Engineering Coordinator

Enclosures



#1410

FILED FOR RECORD
ESCROW TRUST AGREEMENT 3‘49-‘-%—°C'°Ck_p_M
APR 26 2016

THE STATE OF TEXAS JENNEER UINDENZWEIG
COUNTY OF HUNT COUNTY B. '

This contract and agreement made and entered into on this the 7th day
of April 2016, by and between Hunt County Commissioner Jim Latham,
Precinct 4 and J. W. Connally by hereinafter called “Purchaser”.

WITNESSETH:

That said Purchaser has deposited into a fund labeled “County Road
Improvement Fund” the amount of $900.00 for the purpose of
constructing a certain site improvement, to wit:

Upgrade approximately 150 feet on CR 4516 from dirt to rock

to be specifically used for the improvements of said road when adequate
funding becomes available. The cost of said improvements shall be
prepared by the Commissioner and agreed upon by the purchaser prior
to the execution of this agreement. Upon receipt of payment, the County
Treasurer shall forward a copy of the deposit warrant to the commissioner
in charge of making said improvements. If for any reason the county has
not completed said improvement within one hundred twenty (120) days
from the date of execution of this agreement the escrowed road
improvement funds shall, at the request of said purchaser, be returned to
purchaser and this agreement shall than become void.

WHEREAS, said improvement is left to the sole discretfion of the responsible
commissioner.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF, the parties hereto have executed this contract
and agreement on this the 7th day of April 2016.

e

ommissiofier's Signdfure Pgrchaser signgffure
Yo Moy <o AT
(Address of pdrchoser) A 4
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DATE
12-Apr
13-Apr
14-Apr
15-Apr
16-Apr
17-Apsf
18-Apr
19-Apr
20-Apr
21-Apr
22-Apr
23-Apr
24-Apr
25-Apr

MALE

169
174
169
169
176
180
176
172
172
170
171
170
176
1M

3034536870 HUNT CO JAIL

05

Fax to: 903-408-4291 Att: Sandy
From: Classification
JAIL COUNT
April 12, 2016 - April 25, 2016

FEMALE HOLDING Hopkins County
34 7 0
34 10 0
31 18 0
31 11 0
32 15 0
34 8 0
32 7 0
33 _ 4 0
k| 15 0
30 1 0
29 5 0
27 16 0
29 9 0
30 8 0

3

OOOOOOOOOOOOOOB

Bo01/001
a1 D ok D
APR 26 2016
JENN)EER LINDENZWEIG
By ounty, TX
Federal JOTAL
99 309
100 318
100 318
99 310
99 322
99 321
99 314
98 307
99 317
100 3
101 306
101 314
101 315
29 308



